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Un apparente incidente stradale riporta l’ispettore Quetti su di un vecchio caso di riciclaggio di denaro
sporco, legato a sabotaggi mortali avvenuti su dei cantieri. L’intuito lo metterà sulle tracce del killer
professionista responsabile, unico collegamento rimasto coi vertici dell’organizzazione, ma le lancette
corrono. Il tempo concessogli prima dell’archiviazione ufficiale dell’indagine si esaurisce inesorabile. Nella
disperata ricerca di una prova che possa tenere ancora aperto il caso, Quetti si imbatterà in Elisa, sensuale
cantante soul amata dal killer. Le malinconiche note della sua voce avvolgeranno l’ispettore, ignaro di un
oscuro passato che lo porterà di fronte a una scelta che non avrebbe mai pensato di dover fare.

Il volume contiene anche il racconto breve "Doppio Gioco", prima avventura di Quetti apparsa sulle pagine
del settimanale Cronaca Vera.
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From reader reviews:

Roberta Granger:

Nowadays reading books become more and more than want or need but also work as a life style. This
reading behavior give you lot of advantages. Associate programs you got of course the knowledge your
information inside the book that improve your knowledge and information. The data you get based on what
kind of book you read, if you want get more knowledge just go with education books but if you want really
feel happy read one using theme for entertaining for example comic or novel. The Anime Assassine - Anche
tu te ne andrai (Italian Edition) is kind of reserve which is giving the reader unforeseen experience.

Tyler Emery:

Reading a book being new life style in this 12 months; every people loves to go through a book. When you
read a book you can get a lots of benefit. When you read ebooks, you can improve your knowledge, mainly
because book has a lot of information in it. The information that you will get depend on what kinds of book
that you have read. If you wish to get information about your research, you can read education books, but if
you act like you want to entertain yourself you are able to a fiction books, such us novel, comics, and also
soon. The Anime Assassine - Anche tu te ne andrai (Italian Edition) offer you a new experience in reading
through a book.

Paul Leavens:

Don't be worry when you are afraid that this book can filled the space in your house, you could have it in e-
book approach, more simple and reachable. That Anime Assassine - Anche tu te ne andrai (Italian Edition)
can give you a lot of buddies because by you investigating this one book you have thing that they don't and
make you actually more like an interesting person. This book can be one of a step for you to get success.
This publication offer you information that perhaps your friend doesn't learn, by knowing more than various
other make you to be great men and women. So , why hesitate? We should have Anime Assassine - Anche tu
te ne andrai (Italian Edition).

Anthony Malloy:

As we know that book is significant thing to add our know-how for everything. By a reserve we can know
everything you want. A book is a pair of written, printed, illustrated or maybe blank sheet. Every year has
been exactly added. This reserve Anime Assassine - Anche tu te ne andrai (Italian Edition) was filled
concerning science. Spend your time to add your knowledge about your technology competence. Some
people has various feel when they reading the book. If you know how big benefit from a book, you can feel
enjoy to read a book. In the modern era like now, many ways to get book which you wanted.
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